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ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY O 4w L O W L~ m
UNIT
2 ea. PRICE 26,004.22 26,850.00 29,063.53
1. Electric (DC) Valve Actuator for 60" Gate Valves TOTAL 52,008.44 53,700.00 58,127.06 NO BID
UNIT
1 day PRICE 1,200.00 1,300.00 1,200.00
2. Manufacturer's Field Services Start-Up (8 hour day) TOTAL 1,200.00 1,300.00 1,200.00 NO BID
UNIT
1LS PRICE
3. Freight to Dos Rios WRC, 3495 Valley Rd., San Antonio, TX 78221 TOTAL 1,715.00 1,850.00 1,800.00 NO BID
*
TOTAL TOTAL 54,923.44 56,850.00 61,127.06 NO BID
EIM DFGA-F EIM DFGA-F EIM DFGA-F
w/Rotork w/Rotork w/Rotork
Make/Model 1W10444:1 1W10444:1 1W10444:1
Net Net Net
Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days
Delivery Days 16-18 weeks 16-18 weeks 126 days
*LOW BIDDER
BID INVITATIONS WERE E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:
Bernard Controls, Inc. KLP Commercial Demandstar
Core & Main Odessa Pumps SAWS Website
Ferguson Rotork
Fortiline Scruggs
Harold Beck Smith Pump

Hartwell Environmental

Weisinger Inc




